Labor Management System Engine Service Bulletin Report

Zone:Zone 12
Bulletin:070148
Open date:02/03/2023
Close date:02/07/2023
Award date:02/13/2023

	Award date: 02/13/2023								
Service	Train		GN-UP	DEPART		ARRIVAL		SIGN-OFF	
		LO	CTIME	LO	CTIME	LO	CTIME	LO	CTIME
LAX									
ELAXS21									
Mon, Tue, Wed									
	0562	LAX	5:20 AM	LAX	6:10 AM	IRV	7:11 AM	IRV	7:31 AM
	0765	IRV	7:31 AM	IRV	7:49 AM	LAX	8:57 AM	LAX	9:17 AM
	0770	LAX	9:17 AM	LAX	10:10 AM	SNC	11:36 AM	SNC	11:56 AM
	0777	SNC	11:56 AM	SNC	1:24 PM	LAX	2:57 PM	LAX	3:27 PM
Sat, Sun									
	0562	LAX	5:20 AM	LAX	6:10 AM	SAN	9:04 AM	SAN	9:24 AM
	0777	SAN	9:24 AM	SAN	12:01 PM	LAX	2:57 PM	LAX	3:17 PM
Exceptions	-		-		-				
2/4/23									
	0562	LAX	5:20 AM	LAX	6:10 AM	SAN	9:04 AM	SAN	9:24 AM
	0562	LAX	5:20 AM	LAX	6:10 AM	SAN	9:04 AM	SAN	9:24 AM
	0777	SAN	9:24 AM	SAN	12:01 PM	LAX	2:57 PM	LAX	3:17 PM
0/5/00	0777	SAN	9:24 AM	SAN	12:01 PM	LAX	2:57 PM	LAX	3:17 PM
2/5/23	0500	LAV	C.OO ANA	1.4.	C:40 AM	CAN	0.04 414	CAN	0.04 004
	0562	LAX	5:20 AM	LAX	6:10 AM	SAN	9:04 AM	SAN	9:24 AM
	0562	LAX	5:20 AM	LAX	6:10 AM	SAN	9:04 AM	SAN	9:24 AM
	0777	SAN	9:24 AM	SAN	12:01 PM	LAX	2:57 PM	LAX	3:17 PM
	0777	SAN	9:24 AM	SAN	12:01 PM	LAX	2:57 PM	LAX	3:17 PM
ELAXS23									
Wed, Thu, Fri									
	0580	LAX	2:20 PM	LAX	3:10 PM	IRV	4:11 PM	IRV	4:31 PM
	0785	IRV	4:31 PM	IRV	5:52 PM	LAX	6:57 PM	LAX	6:57 PM
	0588	LAX	6:57 PM	LAX	7:40 PM	IRV	8:41 PM	IRV	9:01 PM
	0595	IRV	9:01 PM	IRV	10:49 PM	LAX	11:57 PM	LAX	12:17 AM
Sat, Sun									
	0580	LAX	2:20 PM	LAX	3:10 PM	SAN	6:04 PM	SAN	6:24 PM
	0591	SAN	6:24 PM	SAN	7:01 PM	LAX	9:57 PM	LAX	10:17 PM
PRO		LAX	10:17 PM					LAX	12:17 AM
ELAXS24									
Mon, Tue, Wed									
	0784	LAX	4:00 PM	LAX	5:10 PM	SNC	6:36 PM	SNC	6:56 PM
	0591	SNC	6:56 PM	SNC	8:34 PM	LAX	9:57 PM	LAX	11:59 PM
Sat, Sun									
2 5.1., 2 5.1.	0784	LAX	4:00 PM	LAX	5:10 PM	SAN	8:04 PM	SAN	8:24 PM
	0595	SAN	8:24 PM	SAN	9:01 PM	LAX	11:57 PM		
ELAXS26	5555	C/ 11 4	O.2 F1 IVI	O, 11 1	0.01 I W		7 1 7 1 101		/ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \ \
Mon									
	0765	LAX	8:13 AM	LAX	9:13 AM	GTA	12:03 PM	GTA	12:33 PM
	0784		12:33 PM		1:31 PM	LAX	4:48 PM	LAX	5:08 PM
Thu, Fri				٠., ١					J.JJ 1 1VI
, , , , , ,	0562	ΙΔΥ	5:20 AM	LAX	6:10 AM	IRV	7:11 AM	IRV	7:31 AM
Fab 0, 0000 40:40 444	0002	<u> </u>	0.20 AW	- /√/	O. TO AIVI	11 X V	7.11 /\IVI	11 X V	7.01 AW
Feb 2, 2023 10:19 AM									

	0765	IRV	7:31 AM	IRV	7:31 AM	LAX	8:57 AM	LAX	9:17 AM
	0770	LAX	9:17 AM	LAX	10:10 AM	SNC	11:36 AM	SNC	11:56 AM
	0777	SNC	11:56 AM	SNC	1:24 PM	LAX	2:57 PM	LAX	3:27 PM
Sat, Sun									
	0564	LAX	6:20 AM	LAX	7:10 AM	SAN	10:04 AM	SAN	10:24 AM
	0581	SAN	10:24 AM	SAN	2:01 PM	LAX	4:57 PM	LAX	5:17 PM

EXTRABOARD

EXLAX06

Mon, Tue, Wed, Fri, Sat, Sun

EXLAX31

Mon, Tue, Thu, Fri, Sat, Sun

EXLAX52

Mon, Tue, Wed, Thu, Fri, Sun

EXLAX55

Mon, Tue, Thu, Fri, Sat, Sun

EXLAX56

Mon, Wed, Thu, Fri, Sat, Sun

EXLAX57

Mon, Tue, Wed, Fri, Sat, Sun

Service Train SIGN-UP DEPART ARRIVAL SIGN-OFF LOC--TIME LOC--TIME LOC--TIME LOC--TIME

MCD

EXTRABOARD

EXMCD04

Mon, Wed, Thu, Fri, Sat, Sun

Service Train SIGN-UP DEPART ARRIVAL SIGN-OFF LOC--TIME LOC--TIME LOC--TIME LOC--TIME

OAK

EXTRABOARD

EXOAK06

Mon, Tue, Thu, Fri, Sat, Sun

EXOAK10

Mon, Tue, Thu, Fri, Sat, Sun

EXOAK11

Mon, Tue, Thu, Fri, Sat, Sun

EXOAK13

Mon, Tue, Thu, Fri, Sat, Sun

EXOAK18

Mon, Tue, Thu, Fri, Sat, Sun

EXOAK21

Mon, Tue, Thu, Fri, Sat, Sun

EXOAK23

Mon, Tue, Thu, Fri, Sat, Sun

EXOAK24

Mon, Tue, Thu, Fri, Sat, Sun

EXOAK26

Mon, Tue, Thu, Fri, Sat, Sun

EXOAK27

Mon, Wed, Thu, Fri, Sat, Sun

EXOAK29

Mon, Tue, Wed, Fri, Sat, Sun

Service Train SIGN-UP DEPART ARRIVAL SIGN-OFF LOC--TIME LOC--TIME LOC--TIME LOC--TIME

SAC

EXTRABOARD

EXSAC23

Mon, Tue, Thu, Fri, Sat, Sun

Service	Train		GN-UP CTIME	DEPART LOCTIME		ARRIVAL LOCTIME		SIGN-OFF LOCTIME	
SAN									
ESAN011									
Mon, Tue, Wed, Thu	1765	SAN	4.26 AM	CAN	5:36 AM	OSD	6:30 AM	OSD	G:EO AM
	1562	_	4:36 AM	SAN				SAN	6:50 AM
	CREW PROTECT UNTIL	OSD	6:50 AM		8:40 AM	SAN	9:41 AM	SAIN	12:36 PM
Sun	OKEW I KOTEOT OMTE	- 7001	SINIVILIALI	IL OI					
	0761	SAN	3:01 AM	SAN	4:01 AM	LAX	6:57 AM	LAX	7:17 AM
	0770	LAX	7:17 AM	LAX	10:10 AM	SAN	1:07 PM	SAN	1:17 PM
	CREW PROTECT UNTIL	_ ASSI					-		
ESAN012									
Tue, Wed, Thu, Fri									
	1567	SAN	5:23 AM	SAN	6:23 AM	OSD	7:15 AM	OSD	7:35 AM
	1770	OSD	7:35 AM	OSD	12:34 PM	SAN	1:34 PM	SAN	1:54 PM
Sat	CREW PROTECT UNTIL	_ ASSI	JNMENI I	IE UP					
Sai	0765	SAN	5:01 AM	SAN	6:01 AM	LAX	8:57 AM	LAX	9:17 AM
DHC	0770	LAX	9:17 AM	LAX	10:10 AM	SAN	1:07 PM	SAN	9.17 AM 1:17 PM
DHC	CREW PROTECT UNTIL				TO. TO AIVI	SAIN	1.07 FIVI	SAIN	1.17 FIVI
ESAN013 Mon, Thu, Fri	OKEW I KOTEOT ONTIL	- 7001	SINIVILINI	IL OI					
, ,	1777	SAN	10:03 AM	SAN	11:03 AM	OSD	11:54 AM	OSD	12:14 PM
	1774	OSD	12:14 PM	OSD	2:30 PM	SAN	3:29 PM	SAN	6:30 PM
	CREW WILL PROTECT	UNTIL	ASSIGNMI	ENT TII	E UP				
Sat, Sun									
	0567	SAN	6:01 AM	SAN	7:01 AM	LAX	9:57 AM	LAX	10:17 AM
	0774		10:17 AM		12:10 PM	SAN	3:04 PM	SAN	3:24 PM
504N044	CREW WILL PROTECT	UNTIL	ASSIGNMI	ENT TII	E UP				
ESAN014									
Mon, Tue, Wed	1785	SAN	2:26 PM	SAN	3:25 PM	OSD	4:27 PM	OSD	4:47 PM
	1784		4:47 PM		7:28 PM				
	CREW PROTECT UNTIL				1.20 F IVI	SAIN	0.25 FIVI	SAN	10.20 FIVI
Sat, Sun	OKEW FROTEOT OWIL	- / (00)	SINIVILIA I	12 01					
·	0785	SAN	3:01 PM	SAN	4:01 PM	LAX	6:57 PM	LAX	7:17 PM
	0794	LAX	7:17 PM	LAX	10:10 PM	SAN	1:04 AM	SAN	1:24 AM
	CREW PROTECT UNTIL	_ ASSI	GNMENT T	IE UP					
ESAN016									
Mon									
	1567				6:23 AM				7:35 AM
	1770		7:35 AM		12:34 PM	SAN	1:34 PM	SAN	1:54 PM
Tue	CREW PROTECT UNTIL	_ ASSI0	GNMENT T	IE UP					
Tue	1777	CVVI	10.02 \\	CVVI	11:03 AM	OSD	11·5 <i>1</i> AM	OGD	12·14 DM
	1774 CREW PROTECT UNTIL		12:14 PM SNIMENT T		2.30 PIVI	SAIN	3:29 PM	SAN	6:30 PM
Fri	ONL VV I NOTEOT OIVIIL	_ 7,0010	OTAIVILINI I	IL OF					
•	1765	SAN	4:36 AM	SAN	5:36 AM	OSD	6:30 AM	OSD	6:50 AM
	1562	OSD		OSD		SAN	9:41 AM		12:36 PM
		- J - J - J	2.30 / 1111		2	2	2/	J •	

Feb 2, 2023 8:44 AM

	CREW PROTECT UNTIL ASSIGNMENT TIE UP								
Sat									
	0761	SAN	3:01 AM	SAN	4:01 AM	LAX	6:57 AM	LAX	7:17 AM
	0770	LAX	7:17 AM	LAX	10:10 AM	SAN	1:07 PM	SAN	1:17 PM
	CREW PROTECT UNTI	L ASSI	GNMENT T	IE UP					
Sun									
	0765	SAN	5:01 AM	SAN	6:01 AM	LAX	8:57 AM	LAX	9:17 AM
DHC	0770	LAX	9:17 AM	LAX	10:10 AM	SAN	1:07 PM	SAN	1:17 PM
	CREW PROTECT UNTI	L ASSI	GNMENT T	IE UP					
ESAN017 Wed									
	1777	SAN	10:03 AM	SAN	11:03 AM	OSD	11:54 AM	OSD	12:14 PM
	1774	OSD	12:14 PM	OSD	2:30 PM	SAN	3:29 PM	SAN	6:30 PM
	CREW PROTECT UNTI	L ASSI	GNMENT T	IE UP					
Thu, Fri									
	1785	SAN	2:26 PM	SAN	3:25 PM	OSD	4:27 PM	OSD	4:47 PM
	1784	OSD	4:47 PM	OSD	7:28 PM	SAN	8:25 PM	SAN	10:26 PM
	CREW PROTECT UNTIL ASSIGNMENT TIE UP								
Sat, Sun									
DHC	0581	SAN	1:31 PM	SAN	2:01 PM	LAX	4:57 PM	LAX	5:17 PM
	0588	LAX	5:17 PM	LAX	7:10 PM	SAN	10:04 PM	SAN	10:24 PM
	CREW PROTECT UNTI	L ASSI	GNMENT T	IE UP					

National Railroad Passenger Corporation

Zone:**Zone 12**

Awards to Bulletin#:6

Open date:01/27/2023

Award date: 02/06/2023

If you are awarded an assignment for which you are not fully qualified, you must notify your immediate supervisor

			<i>,</i> , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,		
Vacancy Number	Assignment	First Name	Last Name	Seniority	Previous Assignment
LAX					
1	EXLAX06	No Bid	s Received, Readvertise	e in Accordance w	rith Rule 6i.
2	EXLAX31	No Bid	s Received, Readvertise	e in Accordance w	rith Rule 6i.
3	EXLAX52	No Bid	s Received, Readvertise	e in Accordance w	rith Rule 6i.
4	EXLAX55	No Bid	s Received, Readvertise	e in Accordance w	rith Rule 6i.
5	EXLAX56	No Bid	s Received, Readvertise	e in Accordance w	rith Rule 6i.
6	EXLAX57	No Bid	s Received, Readvertise	e in Accordance w	rith Rule 6i.

Vacancy Number	Assignment	First Name	Last Name	Seniority	Previous Assignment
MCD					
7	EMB004	JOSE	FLOTTE	1058	EXMCD04

Vacancy Number OAK	Assignment	First Name	Last Name	Seniority	Previous Assignment
8	EXOAK06	No Bids	Received, Readvertis	e in Accordance w	ith Rule 6i.
9	EXOAK10	No Bids	Received, Readvertis	e in Accordance w	ith Rule 6i.
10	EXOAK11	No Bids	Received, Readvertis	e in Accordance w	ith Rule 6i.
11	EXOAK13	No Bids	Received, Readvertis	e in Accordance w	ith Rule 6i.
12	EXOAK18	No Bids	Received, Readvertis	e in Accordance w	ith Rule 6i.
13	EXOAK21	No Bids	Received, Readvertis	e in Accordance w	ith Rule 6i.
14	EXOAK23	No Bids	Received, Readvertis	e in Accordance w	ith Rule 6i.
15	EXOAK24	No Bids	Received, Readvertis	e in Accordance w	ith Rule 6i.
16	EXOAK26	No Bids	Received, Readvertis	e in Accordance w	ith Rule 6i.
17	EXOAK27	No Bids	Received, Readvertis	e in Accordance w	ith Rule 6i.
18	EXOAK29	No Bids	s Received, Readvertis	e in Accordance w	ith Rule 6i.

Vacancy Number	Assignment	First Name	Last Name	Seniority	Previous Assignment
SAC					
19	EXSAC23	No Bids	Received, Readvertis	e in Accordance w	rith Rule 6i.